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Price

2 900 zł
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KRAKÓW
Sołtysa Dytmara

Size Rooms Bedrooms Bathrooms Floor

37.00 m2 1 1 1 2

Dodatkowe udogodnienia:

 Lift
 Balcony
 Security

Mint Property is pleased to present a modern apartment for rent,
located on Soltys Dytmar street in the prestigious Salwator Tower
development, in Bronowice district.

The 37 m² property is located on the 2nd floor of a modern apartment
building and consists of:

* a bright living room with a kitchenette,

* a functional bathroom,

* a spacious hallway.

The apartment includes a large balcony of about 10 m², ideal for
morning coffee or a moment of relaxation after work.

The apartment is freshly renovated - the walls have been repainted,
and an elegant barlinek board has been laid on the floor. The
kitchenette is equipped with modern furniture and new household
appliances: induction hob, refrigerator, hood and dishwasher. An
additional advantage is the possibility of retrofitting the apartment with
furniture according to the tenant's preferences.

Salwator Tower is a premium investment, offering exceptional
amenities for residents:

24-hour reception and monitoring,

swimming pool, saunas, gym,

tennis court

In the immediate vicinity there are stores, restaurants and service
outlets, which significantly increases the comfort of everyday life.

An ideal proposition for those who appreciate comfort, security and high
standard of living. Apartment available immediately - feel free to
contact us and arrange a presentation!

Lokalizacja:

Salwator Tower is located in a well-communicated part of Krakow, which
is an important asset both for people living permanently and for
investors looking for real estate for rent. Numerous public
transportation stops are available near the building - streetcars and
buses provide quick and convenient access to the city center,
universities, office buildings and other districts. A trip to the Old Town
takes only a dozen minutes.

 The proximity of Armii Krajowej Street provides efficient exit from the
city in the direction of the A4 highway, which is beneficial for frequent
travelers.
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